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Office Phone: 409-882-3339  

crystal.halliburton@lsco.edu   

Education 

A.A.S, Registered Nurse, 2018, Lamar State College Orange, Orange, Texas 

Certificate, Licensed Vocational Nurse 2016, Lamar State College Orange, Orange, Texas 

Licensures and Certifications 

BLS, NRP, S.T.A.B.L.E, ATI champion 

Honors and Awards 

Phi Theta Kappa Honor Society, Alpha Nu Gamma Chapter 2015 

Professional Experience 

01/2024- Present Registered Nurse Lamar State College Orange Vocational Nursing Instructor 

Helping nursing students gain practical experience through clinical Instruction. Promoting safety and best 
practices in patient care. Supervise and monitor clinical activities, application of new nursing skills, theories 
and knowledge application in clinical settings. Provide constructive feedback to students and evaluate student 
clinical performance. Serving as a mentor and using teaching strategies to promote student learning, success, 
and retention. 

2023-2024 Registered Nurse Baptist Hospitals of Southeast Texas Mother-Baby/Gynecology  

Educating patients about postpartum and newborn care. Administering medications, blood transfusions and 
blood products. Monitoring mother and baby for potential signs of complications. Assessing mother for post-
partum complications and hemorrhage risk. Caring for patients in isolation. Floating to Labor & delivery or 
NICU to assist as needed. 



2020-2023 Registered Nurse The Medical Center of Southeast Texas 
Postpartum/Gynecology/Medical Surgical Nurse  

Educating patients about postpartum and newborn care. Administering medications, blood transfusions and 
blood products. Monitoring mother and baby for potential signs of complications. Assessing mother for post-
partum complications and hemorrhage risk. Caring for patients in isolation. Floating to NICU to assist as 
needed. Educating patients about disease processes and treatment plans. Communicating with providers to 
determine the best treatment plans for patients. Initiating care plans and making changes as needed. Caring 
for patients in isolation. Floating to other units as needed. 

2019 Registered Nurse Omnibus Home Health Care  Home Health Nurse 

Providing direct nursing care in the Patient’s home. Monitoring Patient vitals and status, then reporting any 
abnormal findings to LIP. Collaborating with Physicians to determine treatment plan. Wound care. 
Admissions, Recertifications, Resumption of Care, and Discharges. Initiating and revising care plans. Patient 

teaching on health condition, treatments, maintenance, and discharge planning. 

2019 Registered Nurse Advanced Pediatric Care, Inc.  Home Health Nurse 

Providing direct nursing care in the patient’s home, school, traveling, and at appointments. Monitoring patient 
vitals and patient status throughout the shift, using nursing knowledge to make precautionary changes in the 
patient's care as needed. Collaborating with Physicians to determine treatment plan. Administering 
medications and feedings per Gastrostomy button. Administering respiratory treatments and performing 
suctioning as needed. Provide daily care such as toileting, bathing, and grooming. Using nursing knowledge 

in emergent situations to ensure maximum safety of patient. 

2017-2018 Licensed Vocational Nurse Dr. Don Duplan, M.D. Office Nurse 

Assisting provider with office procedures and patient care. Medication Administration. Answering nurse phone 
calls. Inputting charges for billing. 

2005-2014  Office Receptionist  Dr. Wesley Palmer, D.O. Front Office Receptionist 

Answering multi-line telephones. Scheduling appointments. Checking patients in/out of computer. Applying 

payments to accounts, balancing money drawer. Filing documents and charts. Faxing documents. 

Teaching Experience  

01/2024-present Clinical Nursing instructor, Lamar State College Orange 

2023 Assisted the Education department with mandatory learning courses, The Medical Center of 

Southeast Texas 
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Christina Irion   Registered Nurse   Groves, TX 

Brandi Coats   Patient Advocate   Fannett, TX 

Mindy Randall   Registered Nurse   Bridge City, TX 


